

2018 BID TABULATION
Request For Bids - Water Treatment Chemicals
Upper Oconee Basin Water Authority
Bear Creek Reservoir and Water Treatment Facilities

			BIDDER															
			AFC-Affinity		BMS-Brenntag		CCO-Carus		CCU-Chemtrade		CDR-Cedar		CPS-Crop		CSC-C&S			
CHEMICAL	UNIT	QUANTITY	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE		
ALUMINUM SULFATE	Dry Pound	830,000	\$0.1095	\$90,885.00		NO BID		NO BID		\$0.1325	\$109,975.00		NO BID		NO BID	\$0.0990	\$82,170.00	
SODIUM HYDROXIDE	Wet Pound	1,000,000		NO BID	\$0.0974	\$97,400.00		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	\$0.0840	\$84,000.00
CHLORINE	Ton	56		NO BID	\$569.0000	\$31,864.00		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID
HYDROFLUOROSILIC ACID	Wet Pound	100,000		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID
PHOSPHATE	Wet Pound	100,000		NO BID		NO BID	\$0.3300	\$33,000.00		NO BID		\$0.3760	\$37,600.00		NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
LIQUID ALGAECIDE	Gallon	1,500		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		\$17.4100	\$26,115.00	\$14.3600	\$21,540.00		NO BID	NO BID

			BIDDER													
			ICI-Industrial		JCI-Jones		PCI-Pencco		SCC-Shannon		SWT-Sterling		UUI-Univar			
CHEMICAL	UNIT	QUANTITY	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE		
ALUMINUM SULFATE	Dry Pound	830,000	\$0.1500	\$124,500.00		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		
SODIUM HYDROXIDE	Wet Pound	1,000,000	\$0.1300	\$130,000.00		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	\$0.0954	\$95,400.00		
CHLORINE	Ton	56		NO BID	\$650.0000	\$36,400.00		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		
HYDROFLUOROSILIC ACID	Wet Pound	100,000	\$0.1775	\$17,750.00		NO BID	\$0.1235	\$12,350.00		NO BID		NO BID	\$0.1870	\$18,700.00		
PHOSPHATE	Wet Pound	100,000		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	\$0.3580	\$35,800.00	\$0.3666	\$36,660.00		NO BID		
LIQUID ALGAECIDE	Gallon	1,500		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	\$18.9960	\$28,494.00	\$14.6330	\$21,949.50		

- | | | | |
|-----|--------------------------------|-----|---------------------------------|
| AFC | Affinity Chemical, LLC | ICI | Industrial Chemicals, Inc. |
| BMS | Brenntag Mid-South | JCI | Jones Chemical, Inc. |
| CCO | Carus Corporation | PCI | Pencco, Inc. |
| CCU | Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC | SCC | Shannon Chemical Corporation |
| CDR | Cedar Chem, LLC | SWT | Sterling Water Technologies LLC |
| CPS | Crop Production Services, Inc. | UUI | Univar USA Inc. |
| CSC | C&S Chemicals | | |