2017 BID TABULATION

Request For Bids - Water Treatment Chemicals
Upper Oconee Basin Water Authority
Bear Creek Reservoir and Water Treatment Facilities

BIDDER
AFC-Affinity BMS-Brenntag BPI-Brown CCU-Chemtrade CDR-Cedar CSC-C&S
CHEMICAL UNIT QUANTITY |BID UNIT PRICE |BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE |BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE |BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE |BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE |BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE |BID PRICE
ALUMINUM SULFATE Dry Pound 605,000 $0.1095 $66,247.50 NO BID NO BID $0.1800 $108,900.00 NO BID $0.0990 $59,895.00
SODIUM HYDROXIDE Wet Pound 755,000 NO BID $0.7890 $595,695.00 $0.0925 $69,837.50 NO BID NO BID $0.0740 $55,870.00
CHLORINE Ton 56 NO BID $510.0000 $28,560.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
HYDROFLUOROSILIC ACID Wet Pound 100,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PHOSPHATE Wet Pound 100,000 NO BID $0.4280 $42,800.00 NO BID NO BID $0.3760 $37,600.00 NO BID
LIQUID ALGAECIDE Wet Pound 15,000 NO BID $1.7300 $25,950.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CPS-Crop JCl-Jones SCC-Shannon SWT-Sterling UUI-Univar

CHEMICAL UNIT QUANTITY |BID UNIT PRICE |BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE |BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE |BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE |BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE |BID PRICE
ALUMINUM SULFATE Dry Pound 605,000 $0.3500 $211,750.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SODIUM HYDROXIDE Wet Pound 755,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.0760 $57,380.00
CHLORINE Ton 56 NO BID $650.0000 $36,400.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
HYDROFLUOROSILIC ACID Wet Pound 100,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.2000 $20,000.00
PHOSPHATE Wet Pound 100,000 NO BID NO BID $0.3940 $39,400.00 NO BID NO BID
LIQUID ALGAECIDE Wet Pound 15,000 $1.4500 $21,750.00 NO BID NO BID $1.8141 $27,211.50 $1.5000 $22,500.00

AFC Affinity Chemical, LLC CPS Crop Production Services, Inc.

BMS Brenntag Mid-South e} Jones Chemical, Inc.

BPI C.N. Brown Plastics, Inc. scc Shannon Chemical Corporation

ccu Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC SWT Sterling Water Technologies LLC

CDR Cedar Chem, LLC uul Univar USA Inc.

csc C&S Chemicals

Jacobs Confidential 1/17/2017

Page 1



