
UOBWA Chemical Bid Summary

2024 BID TABULATION
Request For Bids - Water Treatment Chemicals
Upper Oconee Basin Water Authority
Bear Creek Reservoir and Water Treatment Facilities

BIDDER
AFC-Affinity BMS-Brenntag CCO-Carus CSC-C&S JCI-Jones PCI-Pencco

CHEMICAL UNIT QUANTITY BID UNIT PRICE BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
ALUMINUM SULFATE Dry Pound 765,000 $0.2400 $183,600.00 NO BID NO BID $0.1930 $147,645.00 NO BID NO BID
SODIUM HYDROXIDE Wet Pound 950,000 NO BID $0.0956 $90,820.00 NO BID NO BID $0.1408 $133,760.00 NO BID
CHLORINE Ton 70 NO BID $2,067.00 $144,690.00 NO BID NO BID $1,950.00 $136,500.00 NO BID
HYDROFLUOROSILIC ACID Wet Pound 145,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.2445 $35,452.50
PHOSPHATE Wet Pound 145,000 NO BID $1.0280 $149,060.00 $0.7800 $113,100.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
LIQUID ALGAECIDE Gallon 1,650 NO BID $16.57 $27,340.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

BIDDER
SCC-Shannon SWT-Sterling TMB-Thornton USA-USALCO UUI-Univar WKS-WORKS

CHEMICAL UNIT QUANTITY BID UNIT PRICE BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
ALUMINUM SULFATE Dry Pound 765,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.2456 $187,903.13 $0.1970 $150,705.00 NO BID
SODIUM HYDROXIDE Wet Pound 950,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.1128 $107,160.00 NO BID
CHLORINE Ton 70 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
HYDROFLUOROSILIC ACID Wet Pound 145,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.2450 $35,525.00 NO BID
PHOSPHATE Wet Pound 145,000 $0.8370 $121,365.00 $0.7751 $112,389.50 $0.8700 $126,150.00 NO BID NO BID $0.7900 $114,550.00
LIQUID ALGAECIDE Gallon 1,650 NO BID $18.4700 $30,475.50 $10.8500 $17,902.50 NO BID $18.5415 $30,593.48 NO BID

AFC Affinity Chemical, LLC SCC Shannon Chemical Corporation
BMS Brenntag Mid-South, Inc. SWT Sterling Water Technologies LLC
CCO Carus LLC TMB Thornton, Musso & Bellemin, Inc.
CSC C&S Chemicals USA USALCO, LLC
JCI Jones Chemical, Inc. UUI Univar Solutions USA, Inc.
PCI Pencco, Inc. WKS WORKS, LLC
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