2019 BID TABULATION
Request For Bids - Water Treatment Chemicals

Upper Oconee Basin Water Authority
Bear Creek Reservoir and Water Treatment Facilities

UOBWA Chemical Bid Summary

Jacobs Confidential

11/15/2018

BIDDER
AFC-Affinity AUC - Allied BMS-Brenntag CCO-Carus CCU-Chemtrade CSC-C&S
CHEMICAL UNIT QUANTITY |BID UNIT PRICE |BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE |BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE |BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE |BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE (BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE (BID PRICE
ALUMINUM SULFATE Dry Pound 620,000 $0.1235 $76,570.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.1550 $96,100.00 $0.1140 $70,680.00
SODIUM HYDROXIDE Wet Pound 760,000 NO BID NO BID $0.0955 $72,580.00 NO BID NO BID $0.0890 $67,640.00
CHLORINE Ton 60 NO BID $805.0000 $48,300.00 $509.0000 $30,540.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
HYDROFLUOROSILIC ACID Wet Pound 100,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PHOSPHATE Wet Pound 100,000 NO BID NO BID $0.5600 $56,000.00 $0.3500 $35,000.00 NO BID NO BID
LIQUID ALGAECIDE Gallon 1,900 NO BID NO BID $16.5000 $31,350.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
BIDDER
JCl-Jones PCI-Pencco SCC-Shannon SWT-Sterling UUI-Univar

CHEMICAL UNIT QUANTITY |BID UNIT PRICE |BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE |BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE |BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE (BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE (BID PRICE
ALUMINUM SULFATE Dry Pound 620,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SODIUM HYDROXIDE Wet Pound 760,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.0939 $71,364.00
CHLORINE Ton 60 $700.0000 $42,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
HYDROFLUOROSILIC ACID Wet Pound 100,000 NO BID $0.1310 $13,100.00 NO BID NO BID $0.1490 $14,900.00
PHOSPHATE Wet Pound 100,000 NO BID NO BID $0.4320 $43,200.00 $0.3446 $34,460.00 NO BID
LIQUID ALGAECIDE Gallon 1,900 NO BID NO BID NO BID $19.7625 $37,548.75 $14.0000 $26,600.00

AFC Affinity Chemical, LLC ICl Jones Chemical, Inc.

AUC Allied Universal Corporation PCI Pencco, Inc.

BMS Brenntag Mid-South SCC Shannon Chemical Corporation

cco Carus Corporation SWT Sterling Water Technologies LLC

CCcu Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC uul Univar USA Inc.

Ccsc C&S Chemicals
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